5 CODECOUNCIL
a1 TRAINING

201 5 IBC® Trans:t:on from
the 2009 IBC®

Basedé-on the International Bu:/dmg Code® (IBC®)

A

. INTERNATIONAL
CODECOUNCIE



2015 IBC Transition from the 2009 IBC

First Printing: March 2015

COPYRIGHT © 2015

by
International Code Council, Inc.

ALL RIGHTS RESERVED. The 2015 IBC Transition from the 2009 IBC is a copyrighted work owned by the
International Code Council, Inc. Without advance written permission from the copyright owner, no part of this book
‘may be reproduced, distributed, or transmitted in any form or by any means, including, without limitation,
electronic, optical or mechanical means (by way of example and not limitation, photocopying, or recording by or in
an information storage retrieval system). For information on permission to copy material exceeding fair use, please

contact: ICC Publications, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478. Phone 1-888-ICC-SAFE
(422-7233). ‘

Trademarks: “International Code Council,” the “International Code Council” logo, the “IBC” and the “International
Building Code” are trademarks of the International Code Council, Inc.

PRINTED IN THE U.S.A.

lNTER N A']' I D N AL CODE cﬂu Nc| I:) ggg:il; :‘ol,qc;r fltili;n::i T;irgé‘(-‘:i éﬁ;:_,;?hlo(l}izf{;rf RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topie | 2012 2015

Part 1 Administration (Chapters 1 and 2)

Change of use or 1111

occupancy A change in a building's use, or portion of a

building’s use, with no change in its occupancy
classification now requires that a new certification
of occupancy be issued by the building code

official.
Definitions 202
For consistency and usability purposes, all
definitions of terms specifically defined in the IBC
have now been moved to a single location in
) Chapter 2
Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6)
Assembly rooms 303.1.3
associated with Group E The allowance for a Group E classification of
occupancies accessory assembly spaces in school buildings has
been clarified so as to not confuse the provision
with the mixed-occupancies requirements dealing
with accessory occupancies as regulated by Section
_ 5082,
Occupancy classification 303.3, 306.2
of food processing The appropriate occupancy classification of a
facilities and commercial | commercial kitchen has been clarified based
kitchens upon the kitchen’s relationship, or lack of a
relationship, to dining facilities.
304.1

Small (2,500 sq. ft. or less in area) food processing
establishments and commercial kitchens not
associated with dining facilities are now considered
as Group B occupancy.

306.2

A classification of Group F-1 is now applied only to
t larger-sized (over 2,500 sq. ft. in area) food
processing facilities and commercial kitchens not
associated with dining facilities.

Training and skill 304.1

development facilities . The Group B classification for training and skill
development uses has been clarified to address the
ages of the occupants using the facility, the
occupant load limitation where the facility is used
for assembly purposes, and the types of permitted
uses.

Facilities generating Table 307.1(1), Section 307.4

combustible dusts In the determination of occupancy classification for a
facility where combustible dusts are anticipated, a
technical report and opinion must now be provided to
the building official that provides all necessary
information for a qualified decision as to the potential
combustible dusts hazards.

Page 1

INTER N A-”UN A'_ COQE CDUNCIE) i(;;g:ﬁ: Eoﬁgrmerdegzé;fccﬁéﬁg.;ﬁ)iﬁ? RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic

]2012

|2015

Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6), continued

Definition of care facilities

308.2, 202

A number of new definitions related to care
facilities have been added and some existing
definitions have been revised to provide clarity and
consistency in application.

Group I-1 occupancy
classification

308.3

The uses permitted in Group I-1 custodial tare
facility have been expanded to include care
recipients who may need a limited degree of verbal
or physical assistance if responding to a fire or other
emergency situation.

Occupancy classification for
medical care facilities.
Group I-2 occupancy
classification

308.4

Two basic conditions of Group I-2 medical care uses
that have previously been regulated togetheras a
single category have been created, dividing the
classification into short-term care facilitates, such
as, hospitals, and long-term care facilities, such as
nursing homes.

Group R-3 lodging house

310.5

Lodging houses are now specifically defined in
Chapter 2 and are typically permitted to be
constructed in accordance with the International
Residential Code (IRC) if they contain no more than
five guest rooms.

Group R-4 occupancy
classification

310.6
The allowance for constructing Group R-4 supervised
residential facilities under the IRC has been eliminated.

310.6

The uses permitted in a Group R-4 custodial care facility
have been expanded\to include care recipients who may
need a limited degree of verbal or physical assistance
while responding to a fire or other emergency situation.

Classification of accessory
storage spaces

311.1.1

Storage rooms less than 100 square feet in floor area
are not to be classified as Group S, but rather as the
same occupancy as the portion of the building to which
they are accessory.

Open mall buildings

402

A variety of changes have now been made to clarify
the open mall building provisions that were
originally developed for covered mall conditions.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

Page 2

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic |2012 | 2015
Part 2 Building Planmng (Chapters 3 through 6), continued
Private garages — Definition, 202
floor-area limitation . Motor vehicles stored in a “private garage” are now

limited through a new definition to only those
vehicles used by tenants of the building or buildings
on the same premises as the garage.

406.3.1

A group U private garage is now limited to a
maximum floor area of 1000sf, however, multiple
Group U private garages are permitted in the same
building where they are compartmentalized by
minimum 1-hour fire separations.

Each Group U private
garage limited to 1000 sq. ft.

Minimum 1-hour
fire barriers (typical)

T F?if'? Wﬂm 7/
&lmtu 5 évl'£ L)

Example: If non-sprinklered building of Type VB construction,
total allowable area limited to 5500 sq. ft.
plus any applicable frontage increase

Topic 2012 ) 2015
Public parking garage 4064

Those parking structures that fall outside of the
scope of Section 406.3 regulating private parking
garages are now identified as public parking garages.
Group I-2 shared living 407.2.5

spaces ) Shared living spaces, group meeting area, and
multipurpose therapeutic spaces are now permitted
to be open to corridors in Group [-2, Condition 1
nursing homes provided fire specific conditions are
met.

Group I-2 cooking facilities 407.2.6

A room or space containing a cooking facility with
domestic cooking appliances is now permitted to be
open to the corridor in a Group I-2, Condition 1
nursing home provided 13 specific conditions are

; met.
Maximum size of Group 1-2 : 407.5 )
smoke compartments The maximum allowable smoke compartment size

for Group 1-2, Condition 2 hospitals and similar
occupancies has been increased to 40,000 square
feet. )

Technical production areas |410.6.3, 202

. Outdated terminology, such as fly galleries,
gridirons, and pin rails, has been replaced by the
general and comprehensive term “technical
production area” and the special means of egress
provisions for such areas have all been relocated to
Section 410. )

Page 3

lNTERN AT‘DN AL CODE COUNCII:D ggg:ng‘:; :oNc;rmege‘;ﬁ;Sgléﬁ;ﬁiﬁs RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to LlCenSe



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

' [Topic 2012 2015
Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6), continued
Travel distance in aircraft 412.7

manufacturing facilities The travel distance allowances for aircraft

: manufacturing facilities have been significantly
increased based upon a combination of the
manufacturing area’s height and floor area.

TABLE 412.7 Atrcraft Manufacturing Exit Access Travel Distance

Height ; - Manufacturing Area {sg. .12

feel " 5n0n0 2200.000 2250,000 2500080 2750.000 21.000.000
225 400 450 500 500 500 500
275 100 500 700 850 1000 1.000
2100 400 500 750 1000 1250 - 1500

For SI: 1 foot = 304.6 mu
a._Contiguous foor s of the sireraft manufachish

b, Minimum heieht from finished floor to bottorm of ¢ ceﬂmg orroof ﬁabvm deck.

Ambulatory care facilities |422

In a multi-tenant or mixed-occupancy building where
there are uses present other than an ambulatory
care facility, a fire-partition is now required between
the care facility and those nonrelated spaces where
the ambulatory care facility is intended to have at
least four care recipients incapable of self-
preservation at any one time.

Ambulatory care facility (ACF) Separate tenant space
, ' Fire partition
. ' ) / required where ACF
; has = 4 care
Smoke compartment 1| Smoke compartment 2 recipients incapable
22,500 sf max. 22,500 sf max. of self preservation

Smoke barrier

‘ Minimum of two smoke compartments
where ACF exceeds 10,000 sf

Page 4

l NTE R N A'” D N AL COBE CDUNCII? Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLanghlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.



2015 International Building Code ~Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic |2012 | 2015

Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6), continued

Storm shelters serving 423.3 .

critical emergency The construction of complying storm shelters is now
operations facilities and required in critical emergency operations facilities
Group E occupancies where such facilities are located in geographical

areas where the shelter design wind speed for
tornadoes is at its highest.

423.4

Storm shelters are now required in Group E
occupancies located in those areas of the U.S. where
the shelter design wind speed for tornadoes is at its

, highest.
General building height and 503
area limitations; Building The provisions regulating building height and area
height and number of - limitations have been extensively revised with no
stories, Building area ‘ change in technical application in order to provide

an increased degree of user-friendliness and
technical consistency.

Tables 504.3 & 504.4 .
In order to increase the degree of user-friendliness
of the process by which the allowable building
height provisions are determined, Table 503 has
now been reformatted as Tables 504.3 (Allowable
height in feet) and 504.4 (Allowable number of
stories above grade plane), and any applicable
sprinkler increase has been incorporated directly
into the new tables. '

TABLE 503 504.3* Allowable Building Heights-and-Areas in Feet Above Grade Plane .

Type of Construction
Occupancy Typel Type I Type 11 'l‘yl.m v Type 'V
Classification See Footnotes A B A B A B HT A B
ABEFEMSU NSt UL 160 65 58 65 55 65 50 - 40
) ) s UL 180 85 75 85 s 85 70 B0
H-1, H-2,H-3,H-5 N4
s UL 160 65 35 65 55 65 50 40

Note: UL = Unlimited; NS = Buildings nat equipped throughout wirth an automatic sprinkler system; S = Buildings aquipped throngh-
out with an automatic sprinkler system installed in aceordance with Section 903.3.1.1

{Only a portion of Table.504.3 s shown above.}

TABLE 502 504.4%%  Allowable Building Heights-and-Areas Number.of Stories Above Grade Plane
Type of Construction
Ccbinpandy  Typel Type II Tepe Il Type IV Type V
Classification See Foot-Notes A B A B A B HT A B
A1 N8 UL 5 3 2 3 2 a 2 1
s UL 8 4 3 % 4 .4 3 2
A NS U 1 3 2 3 ) 3 2 1
S s UL 12 4 3 4 3 4 3 2
A3 NS oL m 3 2 3 oz 3 2 1
S UL 12 a E] a 3 & 3 A

Note: UL = Unlimited; NS = Buildings nat equipped througheut with an automatic sprinkler system; S = Buildings equipped through-
out with an antomatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 803.3.1.1

{Only a portion of Tble 502.4.Is shown ubove.)

Page 5

N AL CODE cOUNc“:D igfg:;ﬁ:; zoﬁ?meizﬁéfiéﬁiiiﬂs RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License




2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic

|2012

|zo15

Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6), continued

General building height
and area limitations;
Building height and
number of stories, Building
area, Continuted

Table 506.2

In order to increase the degree of user-friendliness
of the process by which the allowable building area
provisions are determined, Table 503 has been
reformatted as new Table 506.2 (allowable area
factor in square feet), and any applicable sprinkler
increase has been incorporated directly into the
new table.

TABLE 503 506.2%" Allowable Building Heights-and Areas Factor {A, = NS, £1, S13R or SM, as applicable}
in Square Feet
Type of Construction
Occupancy Sea Tvpe ] Type 11 Type IT Type IV Typo ¥
Classification Footnotes A B A B A B HT A B
A’ NS GL UL 15500 8,300 14000 8300 15000 11500  5.500
81 UL UL 52000 234000 56000 32000 60008 46000 22000
UL UL - 46.500 25500 42,000 25300 45000 34500 16500
Al UL UL 18500 - 9500 14000 9.500 13000 115€0 6000
: UL UL 652000 38000 55000 32000 £0000 45000 24000 .
UL UL 46500 28500 42000 28500 45000 3450 18.000°
A3 UL UL 15500 9,500 4,000 9500 15000 11500  £,000
UL UL 52.000 39.000 56000 38.000 60.000 46.00  24.000
UL UL 45500 . 28500 42000 28500 45000 #4500  18.000
{Only a portion of Takle 505.2 is showrrabove.}
Topic 2012 2015
Mezzanine — Means of ’ 505.2.2 )
egress and Openness The specific provisions for mezzanine means of
egress have been deleted and replaced with a
general reférence to Chapter 10.
505.2.3

Direct access to at least one exit at the mezzanine
level is no longer required for those enclosed
mezzanines regulated by Exception 2 of Section
505.2.3. :

Unlimited area buildings —
Accessory occupancies;
Basements in unlimited
area buildings

507.1.1 (507.1)

The allowance for occupancy groups not specifically
scoped under the unlimited area building provisions
of Section 507 to be located in such buildings under
accessory occupancies provisions of Section 508.2 is
now contained within the code text.

507.1
The allowance of a single-story basement in
unlimited area buildings have now been clarified.

Unlimited area buildings —
Group H occupancies;
Group H-5 in unlimited
area buildings

507.8

The limitations placed on Group H occupancies
permitted in unlimited area building have been
clarified and reformatted to aid in their consistent

" | application.

507.9

Group H-5 buildings are now permitted to be
unlimited in area under the special provisions of
Section 507.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

Page 6

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4,2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License




2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic [2012 [2015
Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6), continued
Incidental uses —General  |509.1

provisions; Separation and
- . Protection; Rooms or
areas; Fire protection from
incidental uses

The concept of incidental uses

has been clarified by eliminating the previous
relationship with the mixed-occupancy provisions.
509.4 ;

An automatic sprinkler system is now the only fire-
extinguishing system specifically permitted as a
means of providing any fire protection required for
incidental use rooms and area.

Table 509

The list of incidental uses now includes waste and
linen collection rooms in Group B ambulatory care
facilities and such rooms must be separated from the
remainder of the building by minimum 1-hour fire-
resistance-rated fire barriers and/or horizontal

assemblies.
% Table 509

A more detailed analysis of various support spaces
within a healthcare or ambulatory care facility is
now possible due to modifications to Table 509
regulating incidental uses

INCIDENTAL USES SPECIFIC TO

AMBULATORY CARE FACILITIES

Room or Area ‘2015 IBC. 2012 IBC

Labotatories not classified as Group H

“‘occupancies

1-hous separation or provide
autamatic sprinkler system

Not cansidered as an- incidental use

Waste and linen collection raoms

1-hour separation for rooms where
containers _hava an aggregate VDII;me
of 10 cubic feet or more

1-hour regardless of amount of
collection

Storage rooms more than 100 square
feet in floor area

‘1-hout separation

Not considered 2s an incidental use

INCIDENTAL USES SPECIFIC TO
GROUP I-2 OCCUPANCIES

Room-or Area

20151BC

2012 IBC

' Lehoratories not classified as Group H
| automatic sprinkler system

ocoupancies.

1-hour separation and provide

1-hour separation or provide
automatic sprinkler system

Laundry rooms

1:hour separafion where more than
100 sijuare feet in floor area

1-hour separation or provide
antomatic sprinkler system whete
more-than 100 siuare feet in
floor area

Patient rooms equipped with padded

surfaces

1-hour separation

Not considered as-an incidental use

Physical plant meintsnance shops

t-hour separation

Not considered as an incidental use’

Wasts and linen collection rooms

4-hotir for rooms where containess’
haveé an aggregate volume of 10 cubic’
{eet or more

1-hour regardless of amount of
collection

Storage raoms mars then 100 square
feet in floor area

1-hour separation

Not considered as an incidentsl use

Topic

2012

2015

-separation

Horizontal building

510.2

In the special provisions of Section 510.2 addressing
pedestal buildings, there is no longer a limit of one
story above grade plane for that portion of the
structure that occurs below the 3-hour horizontal

separation.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIE

Page 7

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License
Agreement. No further reproductions authorized. .




2015 International Building Code ~Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic , 2012 : 2015
Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 - 9)

Topic 2012 2015
Identification of fire and 703.7

smoke separation walls The size & location of identifying markings required

on vertical fire assembly’s above-ceiling spaces have
been modified to increase the potential for such
markings to be seen.

Projections at exterior 705.2

walls The minimum required separation between the
leading edge of a projection and the line used to
determine the fire separation distance has been
modified in a manner that provides for a significant
increase in the separation required. Table 705.2 is
modified.

TABLE 705.2 Minimum Distance of Projection

Minimum Distance from Line Used

Fire Separation Distance (FSD) to Determine FSD

0 feet to }ess—t—h&n 2 feet Projections not penmtted

Greate t]:an Z feet to-}ess-l:h-an-s-feet i 24 mches

3 feet feet :

Trf&&t"t)‘l‘ Greater than 3 feet to less *&B—mchee 24 mches glus 8 mches fox

than 30 feet every foot of FSD beyond 3 feet or
- ) ﬁ-achon thereof

30"feet.f)fr’ g:ﬂt eatefj"_‘ T e = 20 feet

For SI 1 foot = 304.8 mm; 1 inch = 25,4 mm,

Combustible projections 705.2.3

The provisions regulating combustible projections
adjacent to an interior lot line or other line used to
determine the fire separation distance have been
modified to provide a simple and consistent
approach that is less restrictive than previously
determined.
Buildings on the same lot 705.3

' Opening are permitted through adjacent exterior
walls of a Group S-2 parking garage and a Group R-2
building on the same lot where such buildings are
regulated as two buildings on the same lot and the
fire separation distance is zero.

Page 8

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License
Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic |2012 |2015
Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 - 9), Continued
Structural element bracing 705.6

of exterior walls Interior structural elements, such as floor or roof

elements, that brace exterior walls are no longer
required to be regulated for fire resistance due to
the exterior wall’s ratings regardless of the
building’s proximity to a.lot line.

706.2

Structural stability of fire  |706.2

walls To satisfy the intended objective of structural The reference to NFPA 221 for fire wall design and
stability the use of a double fire wall complying with | construction has been expanded to permit the use
NFPA 221 is permitted as an alternative to a single | of the “tied” and “cantilevered” options addressed
fire wall. in the standard.
Minimum clear space No connections between
per NFPA 221, Table A5.7 fire walls other than
flashing
Minimum fire wall rating
(in hours)
Rating of | Total double
individual walls| wall rating
3 4
2 3
. ; 1 2
Double fire wall
Intersections of fire 707.8,707.9
barriers at roof assemblies | The void at the intersection between a fire barrier
and a nonfire-resistance rated roof assembly now
need only to be protected with an approved material
rather than a fire-resistant joint system.
Horizontal assemblies and |712 711,712

vertical openings

Significant reformatting in Chapter 7 now places

-| emphasis on the presence of vertical openings rather

than on shaft enclosures, recognizing the use of shaft
enclosures is just one of many acceptable protective
measures that can be utilized to address the hazards
related to vertical openings.

The reorganization of Section 711 and 712 has been
continued such that Section 711 now contains only
the construction requirements for floor and roof
assemblies, and Section 712 only contains the
requirements related to the protection of vertical
openings.

Floor penetration of
horizontal assembly

714.4.1.2 (714.4.1.1.2) Exception 2

An approved through-penetration fire-stop system
used to protect floor penetrations of horizontal
assemblies due to the presence of floor, tub, &
shower drains is no longer required to have a T
rating.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

Page 9

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License




2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic | 2012 [2015
Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 - 9), Continued
Membrane penetration 714.4.2

The ceiling of a 1-hour or 2-hour floor/ceiling or
roof/ceiling assembly is permitted to be interrupted by
double wood top plate of a wall. The wall interrupting
the ceiling membrane of the horizontal assembly must
be sheathed only with Type X gypsum wallboard. The
wall will not require a fire-resistance rating unless
needed due to some other code requirement. ltems
penetrating the top plates must be protected.

L ratings 714.4.4 (714.5), 715.6, 202
An “L” rating identifying the air leakage rate - as

defined in Chapter 2 — is now mandated for
' penetration firestop systems and fire-resistant joint
systems that are utilized in smoke barrier
construction. )
Marking of fire-rated 716.3, 202 :
Table 716.3 has been added to define and relate the
various test standards for fire-rated glazing, now
defined in Chapter 2 to the designations used to
and markings, Fire- mark such glazing.
protection-rated glazing  |Table 716.5
The information previously available in Table 716.5
(715.4 in 2009) addressing the minimum required
fire-protection ratings of fire door and fire shutter
assemblies has been extensively expanded to also
include the maximum size and marking requirements
for door vision panels and the minimum assembly
rating and glazing marking requirements for
sidelights and transoms.

TABLE 715.4716.5 FireBoorani-Eire Shuter-Fire- Protegtion-Ratings
Opening Fire-Protection Assemblies. Ratings, and Markings

glazing assemblies,
Opening protection ratings

Minimun
Fire Door
Required  and Fire Fire-Rated
Wall Shutter Glazing
Assembly  Assembly”  Door Marking Minintum Sidelight/ Fire-Rated Glazing .
* Type of Rating Ratina Yision Doar Vision. Tritsam Assemblv Marking Sidelite!
Assembly (Hours) {Hours) Pincl Size Panel™®  ° Rating (Hours) Trunsom Panel
Fire Fim Fire
Tesistane pmlazion
Fiewallsand 4 a Not- . o MeU.
fire bartiers = Permitted " Pormitted .~
having a required - S
Ere-resistancg
woting greater T3
“than 1 hour 3 e T b
R e 3 wEn At - Nt Mol . - -W-1R0
: Permitted ~ Pormitied .
2 2 1% 106 $q. 905 2 CNelUC Wz
T e %y
1 1% 160860 2100 GoNetc WD
: : Lara BT ' Peymitod
Shafoext 2 o 10002 g Not w120
enclosuras, and rmiftod
exil passagewny D-H-T-\W-40
continred

Page 10

lNTERN A'ﬂUN AL COBE COUN(:"f ggzr:ﬁ:; zoﬁzrfli::hiei';zé ;?ci éﬁ};ﬁiﬁ? RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Table 7165 continued

Minimum
Fire Door .
Required nnd Fire Fire-Rated
Wal Shutter Glazing
Assembly Assembly  Door. Marking Minimum Sidelight/ Fire-Raled Glazing
Type of Raling Rating Vigion “Transom Assembly Marking Sidelite/
stombl_v (Hours) (Hours) Panel Size Ruting (Hours) )
e Fire
e potection  pesistance
Fire barriers 1 1 Y 1
having a mruired
Fime-masistance
' rating of 1 hour:
Enclosures:
forshufls, sist
access stainways,
exil acoess
rasmps, fnterioe
oxil stairways;
interior oxit
ramps, ond Bxit
passigeway walls )
Fite
proteciion :
Other fire 1 % Maximum ~ D-H-NTHS % D-H-NT-15
harriers ’ N
1 Maximtim D20 3t D-H.OH.45
) size tested
Fire partitions 0.5 % Maximum. D20 n I:-H:OH-20
Corridor walls slze tasred i
Other fire 1 % DH-45 % D:H:45
partitions
0.5 ¥ Dtz ¥ D-H.20
Fie Firs Fire Fire ‘
: B . potection  resistane: | protection  esislane
Exterior walls 2 14 100" £100 0} Not 3 Not W.18a
=D-H00  Permitled Permitted
>100in.°
2 1t 100 i03* Not. .2 Not W-120
Permitted Permittnd
o
I}ﬂ.\\’ ai) )
1 % Maximum  [-H-45 ) 115
Fire -
5 : ; potection Sadla
Smoke barriers 1 # Maximum, D20 % DHLOHE

size lestad

2. Tova doors. sachiwith a firy protection cating of T4 hars, installsd on apposite sices of tha same opaning tn a fire wall, shall ba doomad
ognivalont I fire protoction rting to une a-honr fire deor.
b. For 1esting reguirenents, soo %nc!mn 71883,
(_\ Fira-rasistancosmted glazin 5
kcn[gl shora the hundmg is nglllppml throughout with an ntematic spr!
5.

2 shall ba promittad. in the maxiniem si2
inklor und tha fire-rated glazin ineets the critaria establishod

ro-Raterd ¢ hl lazing Markis i 1g Doar Visien Panol,” \\'mr\mn lhnﬂmmqﬂ'm carating of the glazing, wol the Ramia,

Topic |2012 | : ' | 2015
Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 - 9), Continued

Table 716.6 '
In addition to fire window assembly fire protection )
ratings, Table 716.6 now identifies the markings
required on the fire-rated glazing for acceptance in
specified applications.

Wired glass in fire window |716.6.4 (715.5.4 and 715.5.5 in 2009)

The allowance for the use of wired glass without
compliance with the appropriate test standards has
been deleted.

assemblies

Page 11

INTER N A'“ 0 N AL CODE COUNCI L@ igg:ﬁ:; ;o&zrflic;t?:refegzééfgi éﬁ;ﬁiﬁ? RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 ‘AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —~Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic |2012 [2015
Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 - 9), Continued
Corridor dampers 717.3,717.5

Where a duct penetration occurs in the ceiling of a
fire-resistance-rated corridor where the lid of the
corridor is constructed using a corridor wall placed
horizontally, a corridor damper is now specifically
mandated.

Sprinkler systems —
Assembly occupancies on
roofs

903.2.1.6

An automatic sprinkler system is now required to be
installed in a building when the roof is used for a
Group A-2 assembly occupancy with an occupant
load exceeding 100, as well as other Group A
occupancies where the occupant load exceeds 300.

Multiple fire areas

903.2.1.7

Where small Group A fire areas share a common
means of egress, the occupant load of the spaces
must now be added together to determine if a
sprinkler system is required.

Sprinklers systems — Group
R occupancies

903.2.8

Sprinkler requirements for Group R-4 occupancies
are now dependent on the capabilities of the
occupants. In buildings where occupants required
limited assistance when responding to an
emergency condition, additional sprinkler protection
is required for attic space.

Furniture storage and
display in Group F-1, M and
S-1 occupancies

903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.9

Automatic sprinkler systems are now required in
occupancies where upholstered furniture or
mattresses are manufactured, stored, or displayed.

Sprinkler protection for
basements

903.2.11.1.3

Basements provided with walls, partitions, or fixtures
that can obstruct water from hose streams now
require automatic sprinkler protection.

Open-ended corridors

903.3.1.2.2

Where an NFPA 13R sprinkler system is installed, the
sprinkler protection must now be extended to any
open-ended corridors and associated exterior
stairways, clarifying that an open breezeway is
considered as an interior portion of the building and
not an exterior location for the application of
sprinkler requirements.

Actuation of multiple fire-
extinguishing systems

904.3.2

When two or more alternative automatic

fire- extinguishing systems are required to protect a
hazard, all of the systems must now be designed to
simultaneously operate. )

Portable fire extinguishers
in Group R-2 occupancies

906.1

Portable fire extinguishers are no longer required in
many public and common areas of Group R-2
occupancies provided a complying extinguisher is
provided within each individual dwelling unit.

Fire alarm systems in
Group A occupancies

907.2.1 .
Requirements for a fire alarm system in a building
housing two or more Group A occupancies are now
based on whether or not the occupancies are in
separate fire areas. '

Page 12

Copyﬁght to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License
Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic 2012 2015
Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 - 9), Continued
Emergency voice/alarm  |907.2.1.2
communication captions Mass notification fire alarm signals in large stadiums,
arenas, and grandstands now require captioned
messages.
907.2.3

Group E fire alarms

The threshold for alarm systems in Group E
occupancies has been increased such that a manual
fire alarm is required where the occupant load
exceeds 50, and an emergency voice/alarm
communication (EVAC) system must only be
provided for the occupant load exceeds 100. (2012
had dropped thresholds to 30)

Smoke detection and alarm
systems in Group R-2
college buildings

907.2.9.3 .

A smoke detection system, tied into the occupant
notification system, is now required in certain public
and common spaces of Group R-2 college and
university buildings, and the required smoke alarms
within individual dwelling and sleeping units must be
interconnected with the building’s fire alarm and
detection system. '

907.2.3

The scope of the fire alarm provisions for Group R-2
college and university buildings has been revised to
apply to facilities “operated by” the college or
university whether owned by the school or not.

Smoke alarms near cooking
appliances and bathrooms

907.2.11.3,903.2.11.4

Requirements from the NFPA 72 standard
addressing the installation of smoke alarms near
cooking appliances and bathrooms have been
introduced to the IBC in order to provide direct
guidance on the placement of smoke alarms.

Wireless interconnection of
smoke alarms

907.2.11.5 (907.2.11.3)

The smoke alarm interconnection
requirements are now applicable to Group I-1
occupancies and include allowances for use of
wireless alarms.

Smoke and heat removal

910

The format and technical requirements for smoke
and heat removal systems have been revised,
including a new allowance permitting a mechanical
smoke removal system as an alternative to smoke
and heat vents. .

Carbon monoxide alarms

915 (908.7) .

In new and existing buildings, carbon monoxide (CO)
alarms are now required in Group Rand |
occupancies with fuel-burning appliances or attached

garages.

915 :

The carbon monoxide (CO) alarm provisions have
been relocated, reformatted and revised; the scope
has been modified to exclude Group |-3 occupancies
while adding Group E occupancies.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL]

Page 13

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License




2015 International Building Code ~Transition from the 2009 1BC

Topic

| 2012 | 2015

Part 4 Means of Egress (Chapter 10)

Cumulative occupant load

1004.1.1

The determination of the cumulative design
occupant load for intervening spaces, adjacent
levels and adjacent stories has been clarified.

=1l

- u - — - -
. Office . :
10 occupants A c
| Open office area
150 occupants
Office B
10 occupants !
. #a ——Tr
Lobby #
10 occupants
#41. -
—~— o Door #4 sized to accommodate 100 occupants
» Lobby D only requires a single exit
Topic 2012 2015 '

Design occupant load —

Areas without fixed seating | An occupant load factor for museums and exhibit

1004.1.2, Table 1004.1.2

galleries has been established at 30 square feet per
occupant.

TABLE 1004:1-1 1004.1.2 Maximum Floor Area Allowances per

Occupant
‘ Occupant Load Factor®
Function Floer-Areati-Sq-Ft—Per-
of Space Becupant
Assembly
Gaming floars (keno, slots, 2tc.) 11 gross
Exhibit gallery and museum 30 net

Mailbmldmgs—covered and open See Section 402.41

For Sl 1 square foot = 0.0929 m*.
a. Floor area in square feel per nceupant.

Note: {no changes to remainder of table)

Page 14

lNTER N A-“ DN AL COBE CDUNCIE igg:ﬁg; zoﬁzrflﬁ‘f:;de;ﬁdlggj gﬁ;iﬁfj RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC ,

2012 2015

Table 1004.1.2

The mercantile occupant load factor has been
revised such that a single factor is now applicable
regardless of the story on which the mercantile use
is located.

TABLE 1004.1:2 Maximum Floor Area Allowances per Occupant

Topic
Occupant load factors

Function of Space Occupant Load Faclor®
Mercantile ’ 50 gross
Storage, stock, shipping areas 300 gross
For Sk 1 square foot = 0.0929 m®.
4. Floor area in squarg feel per cccupant.
(Bemcining portions of tuble not shown are unchanged)
Topic 2012 2015
Part 4 Means of Egress (Chapter 10). Continued
Means of egress capacity | 1005

| Reduced exit width factors have been established
for sprinklered building provided with an emergency
voice/alarm communication (EVAC) system, and the
exit width/capacity requirements are now presented
in a more logical and organized layout.

determination

1006, 1007

Provisions addressing the minimum required
number of means of egress and their arrangement
for rooms and space as well as stories have been
reformatted and relocated.

The means of egress requirements for rooms and
spaces, along with those for stories, have been
consolidated in Chapter 10. Section 1006 will
address the number of means of egress required
and Section 1007 will address the egress
configuration (arrangement/separation).

Means of egress, Numbers
of exits and exit access
doorways

Exits from dwelling units

Table 1006.3.2 (1021.2(1))

A new section clarifies when a single exit is
permitted within or from an individual dwelling unit.
Changes to Sec. 1021.2 and the tables will also
provide a second option for compliance.

Note: Tables 1021.2(1) and 1021.2(2) in the 2012
code are now Tables 1006.3.2(1) and 1006.3.2(2) in
2015 code due to reformatting of Chapter 10

Spaces with one exit or exit
access doorway

Table 1006.2.1

A new table combines the occupant load
requirements from 2012 1BC Table 1015.1 along
with the provisions for common path of egress
travel from Section 1014.3 into a single location.

See next page for Table 1006.2.1.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

Page 15

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License




2015.International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

TABLET005.2.1 Spaces with One Exif or Exit Acéess Doorway

Maximum Common Path of Egiess Travel
Distance (feet]

Without Sprinkler
System (feet)

Maximum

Occupani Occupant Load With Sprinkler
Occupancy Load of Spac OL <30 OL> 30 System (feet)
ALEM 49 75 75 752
e ﬂ _10_0_ e ‘100‘~
E 498 75 75 100%
Ha HE s R B NE, IR
H-4. H-5 10 NP NP 758
Lledle 10 - NB . N 75
Ia . _ig ' NP1go I\ﬁ&ee 1008
R1 . NP5 NP5 75
R2 10 NP75 NP75 1258
R-a® 10 75 75 1252
g 10 7 1008
8] 49 100 75 75°

For SI; 1 foot = 304.8 mim.
NP = Not Permitted
2. Buildings equipped throughont with an aitornatic sprinkler-system in accordance
with Section 903.5.1.1 or 803.3.1.2. See Sedtion 903 for necapancies where automatic
sprinkler svstems are permitted in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2.
b. Group H occupancies equipped thronghout with an autematic sprinkler system in
accordance with Secticn 903.2.5.

. For a room or space used for assembly purposes having fixed saating, see Section
3628:8 1029.8.

d. For the travel distance Hmitations in Group I-2. see Section 407.4,
8. The length of comman path of egréss travel distance in a Group R-3 peoupancy
located in a mixed occupancy building or within a Group R-3 or R-4 congregate

living fagility.
£ The length of common path of egrass travel distance in a Group S-2 apen parking

garage shall be not more than 100 feet.

Page 16

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED) accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL [pwciieemitrmrmucmenseomnmi,



2015 International Building Code —Transition frdm the 2009 IBC

Topic | 2012 | 2015

Part 4 Means of Egress (Chapter 10). Continued

Exit and exit access 1007.1

doorway configuration Specific information is now provided regarding the

point where exit separation is to be measured. In
addition, where three or more means of egress are
required, performance language has been included
to ensure the egress paths are adequately
separated.

Separation measured at any point
along the width of the doorway

|
\}“_‘j

Separation as required by
— Section 1007.1.1 for two of
the doorways.
 One-half of overall diagonal, or

Additional route
» One-third of diagonal if sprinklered

“a reasonable
distance apart’
to prevent both

being blocked

Space requiring three
or more means of egress

Required separation
distance measured to
closest riser

f

Required separation shall be
maintained for all portions of:
o Exit access stairway

o Exit access ramp

Topic ‘ 2012 2015

Door operations — Locking 1010.1.9 _

systems ' Numerous revisions throughout the locking
provisions now help clarify requirements and their
application through the use of consistent
terminology.

Application of stairway 1011.1 (1009.1)

provisions Stairway provisions have been clarified to apply to
any stairway serving occupied portions of a building,
including “convenience” stairways that are nota
portion of a required means of egress or required
means of egress stairways.

Page 17

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License.
Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.




2015 International Building Code ~Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic 2012 [2015
Part 4 Means of Egress (Chapter 10). Continued

" | Floor level exit signs in 1013.2 (1011.2)
Group R-1 Where general-use exit signs are required in R-1

occupancies, low-level exit signs must also be
provided in the means of egress serving the guest

rooms.
Guards at operable 1015.1 (1013.1, 1013.8)
windows ) The guard requirements for operable windows

having a sill height more than 72 inches above the
finished grade have been relocated from Chapter 14
to the general guard provisions of Chapter 10 and
the minimum window sill height at which a guard is
not required has been increased from 24 inches to

36 inches.
Egress through intervening 1016.2
spaces A means of egress is now permitted through an
' elevator lobby provided access to at least one exit is
available without passing through the lobby.
Travel distance increase for 1017.2.2
Groups F-1and S-1 . |Anincreased exit access travel distance is now

permitted for Groups F-1 and S-1 occupancies where
; specific requirements are met

Aisles in Groups B and M : 1018.3

The required width of aisles in'Groups B and M
occupancies is now consistent with the widths
required for corridors and is no longer limited only
to the capacity based on the occupant load served.

Exit access stairways and 1019 (1009, 1010)

ramps Revisions have been made throughout the code to
coordinate the provisions for unenclosed interior
stairways and ramps (exit access stairways and
ramps) that can be used as a portion of the means of
egress. Relies on the distinction of “exit access”
stair versus “exit” stair.

£

Office suite 4
OL =300

Office suite 1

OL=80
N
vl
Office suite 3 Office suite 2
OL =80 OL =80
Page 18

|NTERN A-“ 0 N AL COBE COUN[:":) igzgg:; :Oﬁzrfﬁ;i,’f:i;z(’,;fi gﬁ;ﬁiﬂ? RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic

|201z

|zo15

Part 4 Means of Egress (Chapter 10). Continued

Enclosure penetrations of
interior exit stairways

1023.5 (1022.5)

Penetrations of the outside membrane of a fire
barrier utilized to enclose an interior exit stair or
ramp are now permitted provided the penetration is
properly protected.

Separation of spaces under
grandstands and bleachers

1029.1.1.1 (1028.1.1.1)

Spaces beneath grandstands and bleachers are now
required to be adequately separated to protect the
assembly seating area form any potential hazards.

Stepped aisle construction
tolerances

1029.13.2.2.1
The variation allowed between adjacent risers
within a stepped aisle is now limited.

Part 5 Accessibility (Chapter 11)

Areas in places of religious
worship

1103.2.8
Small areas used for religious ceremonies are now
exempt from the access requirements.

Employee work areas

1104.3.1

Where an employee work area is less than 1,000
square feet in floor area, the common use
circulation path need not meet the accessible route
requirements.

Multistory buildings and
facilities, Accessible spaces
and routes

1104.4

A distinction has been made between the
requirements for access within a story and those
with greater level changes, such as between stories
or mezzanines.

1107.3,1107.4

The provisions for connecting all spaces within a
building have been modified to clearly identify the
distinction for those with a change of elevation
between storjes or mezzanines.

Group R — Accessible units

1107.6.1.1

The method by which multiple buildings on a site
are reviewed when determining the required
number of Accessible units has been revised to
consider building size in addition to the total
number of units on the site.

Waiting

commons  \ M
X —

NTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

= 3
Meating Rest |(||4 ¥ Office M Sieeping rooms —H——
rooms . rooms E 3 B ;
E
4 o
- ; W
Kitchen % :D%ningA || ey | Activilies -~ - Sleeping rooms
I counseling|| ="
Accessible Units in Group I-1 and R-4 Occupancies
I-1 Occupancies R-4 Occupancies
‘K Condition 1 Condition 2 Condition 1 Caondition 2
>4% but not less than 1 210% but not less than 1 Atleast 1 Atleast 2 units*

* Bedrooms within Group R-4 facilities shall be counted as sleeping units for the purpose of determining the

number of units.

Page 19

Copyright to, or licensed by,
Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License




2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Toplc 2012 2015

Part 5 Accessibility (Chapter 11)
Captioning of public 1108.2.7.3

address announcements The captioning of audible public announcements is
now only required for assembly spaces having a
public address system and 15,000 or more seats.
Accessible children’s 1109.2, 1109.5 |
facilities Toilet facilities and drinking fountains “primarily for
children’s use” may now be installed at a lower
height than generally permitted for accessible
elements and considered as the required accessible
elements.

Recreational facilities 1110

' More detailed scoping requirements for recreational
facilities have been included within the new Section
1110 to coordinate with the ADA and provide the
scoping for technical requirements found within
Chapter 11 of the A 117.1 standard.

Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials
(Chapters 12 through 26)

Toilet and bathroom 1210
The water closet compartment and urinal partition
requirements have been from Chapter 29 to Section

requirements

_ 1210.

Vapor retarders ' 1405.3
The required types and locations appropriate for
each class of vapor retarder have been revised to
also indicate where certain vapor retarders are not
allowed to be installed.

Roof gardens and 1507.16

landscaped roofs, Roof The IBC now provides a reference to a new IFC

loads provisions on roof gardens and landscaped roofs as a

means of controlling the potential hazards these
combustible materials on the roof could create.

Photovoltaic systems 1507.17, 3111, 202

Photovoltaic elements (modules/shingles or
systems) must now meet the general code
requirements for roofing materials and roof top
structures.

Rooftop structures 1510 (1509), 202

In addition to several technical changes, the
provisions addressing rooftop structures have been
reformatted to better organize and clarify the
requirements.

Construction documents, 1603

Special loads Two additional items related to snow load drifting
are now required to be identified on the
construction documents.

1603.1.8

The dead load of any rooftop-mounted photovoltaic
(PV) solar panels must now be identified on the
construction documents. )

Page 20

INTER N Aﬂ D N Ai_ COBE CDU Nc. I:a Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed py Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized. .



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

| 2012 [2015

Topic
Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials

(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued

1604.5

The term “Occupancy category” has been changed
to “risk category” to better reflect the intended
meaning and to coordinate with the terminology
used in ASCE 7-10.

Risk category

1604.5

In the application of assigning the appropriate risk
category for a structure, Section 1604.5 has been
revised to clarify that where standards referred to
ASCE 7 Table 1.5-1, IBC Table 1604.5 should be used
instead. In addition, descriptions for Risk Category
Il structures have been revised to include
occupancy classifications to help clarify the intent.

1607.1

The live loads established in IBC Section 1607 and
Table 1607.1 have been modified and updated in
order to coordinate with the live loads of Chapter 4
and Table 4-1 in ASCE 7-10.

Minimum Live loads

2012 CODE:

TABLE 1607,1 Mininuum Uniformly Distrihuted Live Loads, L. and Minimum Concentrated Live Loads®

NTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIE

Occupancy or Use Uniform (psf) Concentrated (1h)
4. Armories and drill rooms 1507 ' — o
4. Assembly areas endthesters

Fixed seats (fastened to floor) iy
Follow spot. projections. and control rooms 50
Lobbies 1e0®
Movable seats 1608 —
Stagos-md flours 225150
Platforms [assembly) 125100
Other assembly areas 1608 o
5. Balconies {extartor) nud dt.ck\ Same as occupancy served
:-Bowlingalleys 75 —
7= 6. Catwalks 40 3o
o: 8. Comidarsrexceptasotherwiseindicated
First floar 100
Other floors Seme as pccupancy served . —

] excepl indi e

-lB—eren«haH:—-aﬂd-baHmens E) —

H 4 Dmmg rooms ond restaurants 1008 —

43: 11, Elevator machine room grating {on area pf+Hin® — 200

' 2 inches by 2 inchas)
34- 12. Finish light floor plate construction {on area of 4 +is® — 200
lmchbg 1 mch_) 3 T S
35 14 Gorages (passunger vehicles onh] Trucks au d huses. A0S Note 4

Page 21

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

Seu Section 1607.7
Table 1607.1 conlinues

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIE

2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Table 1607.1 continued

Octupancy or Use Uniform [psf) Congentrated (1h)
17-Grandstimds-fesestadiun-and e ¢ " - ikl S T e
-I-S—LMxm-rums—mmﬂmmm}-bmn-::

28 15. Handrails, guards end grsb bers
16. Helipads
22710, Libraries
- Corridors above first floor
Readirip. r’oauis

- Stack fooms ;
23 20. \lnnufaclunnﬂ
Heary
Light
‘24 Rpmnlmgal nsas:

3 Renewmg stam:ls= grands:anrls snd bleschers b
Stadinms and m'em:t \ndx fixed seals (fas(ened 1o floor]
27-25. Residential
One- and two-family dwellings
. Uninhabiteble attics without storage’
Lininhabitabla attics with Hmited storage™+*
Habitable attics and sleeping areas®
Al other areus
Hotels and multiple-family divellings
Private moms énd corridors serving thom
Public ruoms-and comdms serving Lthem
29-Reviewing stands :
20: 26. Rools:
Al roof surfaces subject to maintenance warkers

Awnings and canopies:

Fubric capstruction supported by a Hightweight-rigid
skoleton structure

All other construction
Ordinary flat, pitched. and curved roofs {thal ate nat oceupishle)

Where primary rool members, are exposed to o work Oobr, ot
singls punal points of lower chard of roof trusses, or any point
along primary structural membars supporting roofs:

Over manufacturing, sterge warehouses, and repair gumges
All other scenprneies primary roof members
Roafsused-forotherspectal-pirposes
Roels-used-for-promenade-pirrposes
Reofsused-forroof gardenser

Page 22

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

306 -
B - See Section 1607.8 -
See Seclion 1607.5

i IR e T 1
B0 1000
asghE R
25~ 3000
1258 2000
-91'
1008
1008
ST
52
10
20
30 =
a0
40
100
Nolee
200 .
5
Nonreducible
20
20
2000
300
Notet Note
L]
160

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code ~Transition from the 2009 IBC

QOccupancy or Use . Uniform (psf) . _.Concentrated (Ib)
Qccupiable roofs: ' ' o '
Roof g_ardené 140
Assembly siess 1i08
All other similar areas Nots | Natel
ag— 20. _Sit}g\vaj}:s‘ yehig:ul[n d@i\'aw 's and _vérds.subje‘c‘:l to unéking 256";1'-‘ : ' " Booo”
Bleschers 0" —
Fixedsests{fastened-to-foor} i
v és: 30. Stafrs au& exits o . . . ?;ieienf
One- and two-family dwellings a1 300f
Al other 140 ado!

'ae.- a1 Stm"ag_e warehouses (shall be designed for heavier loads if
raquired for anticipated storage)

Heavy 250% —
Light 1252
37= 32, Stores
Retait
First llaar 100 1000
Upper floors 75 1000
Wholesale, all floors 125" 1000
! 38: 33. Vehicle burriers systems s fap See Soction 1607.8.3
46: 23, Yards and terraces, -Eied'es'lirin» Tq02 =

[barrio.'rs of table nat shown are unchangad)

£ 'The minimum concentrated Joad on stair treads {shall be applisd on an drea of #-syare 2 fnchis by2 inches) js-806-pounds. This load,
naed nog be sssuimed,to act concurrensly with the uniform load, o .

g ‘Where snow loads.oceur thit #re in axcess of the design conditions, the struciure shall be designed 1o support the‘loads due 12 tha
snoreased londs caused by drift buildup br.a greater snéw dosign determined by the building officiel {sea Section 1608). Ferspectak

¥ 'Uui;xhahimblc alfics yeithotit storago aro thaso swhers the maximum Elear height betwaen the joists and raftars is lessthian 42 inches, or
‘whist (lhera are ot twa or more adjacent wusses with web configurations capabla of accommadating an assumied reciangls 42 inches
in height hy by 24 inches dn width, or groater, within the plans of the trusses. Far-stics-without-siotage—This live Inad need net bs
assumad 10 act concurrently with any sther live load requirements.

i Forateirswith-limited-storage-and-constrielet-witl-rasses-this Jive-foad nesd-onty-ha-applind-te-those-périens-ofheotom-chant

" Uninhabitabls attics with storage ars those whers the maximum clear helght bstween the foists and ratters is 42 inchas or greatsy, of
swliere thera are bwo or moso adfacent trusses with the-sime wob configurations capable of eontabiing accommotlating an assumad ract-
sngle 12 inches kigh In helght by 24 inches wide in width, or greater, leestedt withiu tha plang of the trussps

Thetectngloshattfrk thetopofihebotem chard ik bottorafany-other s marmber; providatlrat eack oF the foll ing-Criterix
ts-mmot: The e Ioad need only he applisslie thase portions of tha joists or truss bottem chorels yhe ying conditions am met:
i. The attic araa is accessiblo bywpull-dt hamca-wit

on-stairway orframed-op gy t : from an opening not lass
{han 20 fsies in width by 30 inches in longth that is located whore the cles: height in the.ate ks imynyof 30 inghes: and
it. The slopes of the joists ot truss shall-have s bottom chords pitch-lesshvan-2:12 1ra no greater than 2 wnlts vertical to 12 units horizontal.
rolt-he-desined-for the sreaterofactud-imposed dend-tond-orse-pstzundformiv-distributedoeerthe ene

ha designed | uled coneurran: live load of.

uniformly distrihuted concyrren

k. Attic spaces server by wfivedrstair stainwavs nifies than' prii:dasen type shall badesigned to support the minimuri live lcad specified
{or habitable attics and sleeping rooms. ’ .

1. Reofiwsedforotherspecksl-purpases Areas of necupinble roofs, other than roof gardens snd asseably arens, shall be designad for
appropriale leads as approved by the building official._Unaceupied landscaped aroas of roofs shall ba designed in accordance sith
Section 1607.12.3. X

m. Live load reduction is hot

{Foolnales sol shows cre inchanged)

Page 23

l E N N A‘“ D N AL EODE C UNCILQ ig::;ﬁ:; :,01’\1? fli;e;;ei ;zé;‘?glé‘:g_.;ﬁ(il;s RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic | 2012 [2015
Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials
(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued

Photovoltaic panel systems, 1607.12.5
Ballasted photovoltaic . - Design requirements for roof structures supporting
panel systems . photovoltaic (PV) solar panels and modules have
béen added to Section 1607.
1613.6

Seismic requirements for ballasted roof-mounted
photovoltaic (PV) solar panels have been added to
section 1613.6.

Determination of wind 1609, 202

loads The wind design requirements of Section 1609 have
been updated and coordinated with the latest wind
load provisions in ASCE/SE! 7 (ASCE 7-10) and the
wind load maps in the IBC are now based on
ultimate design wind speeds, V,;, which produce a
strength level wind load similar to seismic load

effects.

Mapped acceleration 1613.3.1, 202 1613.3.1

parameters The IBC seismic ground motion maps have been The U.S. Geological Survey (USGS) recently
updated to reflect the 2008 maps developed by the |developed seismic hazard and Risk-Targeted
United States Geological Survey (USGS) National Maximum Considered Earthquake (MCER) ground

Seismic Hazard Mapping Project and the technical motion maps for Guam and American Samoa, which
changes adopted for the 2009 NEHRP Recommended | have now been included in the IBC.
Seismic Provisions for New Buildings and Other :

‘ Structures (FEMA P750).
Statement of special 1704.3
inspections The provisions requiring specific items to have

special inspection and what information is required
to be included in the statement of special
inspections have been clarified and coordinated,
with previous conflicts between the two being
resolved.

Submittals to the building 1704.5

official Requirements for submittal of reports and
certificates related to construction that is subject to
special inspections and tests are now clearly
specified.

Page 24

INTERN AT l D N AL CGBE CQUNC"f i(;};g:;g:; ioﬁzrmci l;zéigi éﬁ;ﬁiﬁ? RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin cmaJu.u 4,2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic

|2012

[2015

Part 6 Building Erivelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials
(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued

Special inspections

1705

Special inspection requirements for structural steel
have been deleted from Chapter 17 because the new
standard for structural steel buildings (ANSI/AISC
360-10) includes quality assurance provisions.

Requirements pertaining to special inspection of
masonry construction were deleted from Chapter 17
because the 2011 edition of TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE
5 and TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6 includes
requirements for quality assurance of masonry
construction.

1705

Steel construction provisions modified to use new
terminology that coordinates with Chapter.22 and
AISC 360 standard. A new SDI standard addresses
inspection of cold-formed steel floor and roof decks
(SDI QA/QC) (Section 1705.2)

Special inspections required during installation of
open web steel joists and joist girders. (Section
1705.2.3)

Special inspection of cast-in-place anchors in
concrete where allowable loads have been
increased or strength design is used have been
deleted from Table 1705.3 since specific
requirements for design and installation of adhesive
anchors is now included in ACI 318. Continuous
special inspection is added for these anchors
installed horizontally or in upwardly inclined
orientations with sustained loads. (Table 1705.3)
Periodic special inspection of cold-formed steel
special bolted moment frames (CFS-SBMFs) is now
mandated. Modifications to the special inspection
requirements for seismic resistance have been made
to clarify the intent. (Section 1705.12)

1705.17 (1705.16)

Where penetration firestop systems and fire-
resistant joint systems are used in high-rise buildings
and those building assigned to Risk Category Ill and
IV, it is now mandatory that they be inspected by an
approved inspection agency as a part of the special
inspection process.

Structural items moved
from code to standards

Chapter 19

Numerous provisions related to concrete
construction were deleted from Chapter 19 because
they are contained in the 2011 edition of ACI 318.
Building Code Requirements for Structural Concrete
and Commentary. (e.g. IBC Sections 1905, 1906, and
1907 were deleted becaise they only provided
referencing to the corresponding sections in the ACI
318 standard.)

1901.3 Anchoring to concrete

Sections 1908 and 1909 of the 2012 IBC, which
contain the requirements for anchorage to concrete,
have been deleted because they are obsolete and
not consistent with current referenced standards.
In-their place, ne provisions on anchoring to
concrete have been added to the general provisions
found in Section 1901.

1904 Durability requirements

The durability requirements for structural concrete
have been deleted from the IBC and replaced by a
reference to the durability provisions in ACI 318.

|2101.2 Masonry Design Methods

The references in Chapter 21 to specific sections in
the Masonry Standards Joint Committee (MSJC)
code have been deleted because the 2013 edition of
TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 5 has been substantially
reorganized to be more user-friendly. The charging
language of Section 2101.2 has been modified to
simply reference TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 5 or TMS
403 for the design and construction of masonry
structures.

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

Page 25

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License




2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Tépic 2012 . . [2015
Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials
(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued ' o

Structural items moved 2103 Masonry Construction Materials
from code to standards, Masonry material provisions that have historically
Continued : been found in Section 2103 have been deleted

because they are contained in the MSIC
Specification TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6.

2104 Masonry Construction

Many masonry construction provisions previously
found in Section 2104 that are contained in the
MSIC Specification TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6 have
been deleted and replaced with references to the
specification.

2105 Quality Assurance

Provisions for the quality assurance of masonry
structures and related definitions have been deleted
from Section 2106 and replaced with a reference to
the MSJC Specification TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6
and the special inspection and testing requirements
contained in Chapter 17.

Conventional light-frame ; 2308

construction - Section 2308, which contains prescriptive

‘ requirements for conventional wood frame
construction, has been reformatted and reorganized
in its entirety. Significant changes include the
introduction of new designations for wall bracing
method similar to those in the IRC as shown in Table
2308.6.3(1), and reformatted wall bracing
requirements set forthin Table 2308.6.1.

Roof and ceiling framing 2308.7 .

Ceiling joist and rafter span tables from the IRC have
been incorporated into the conventional
construction provisions of the IBC.

Safety glazing — hazardous |2406.1, 2406.4

locations The hazardous locations identified in the safety
.| glazing provisions have been reorganized and -
clarified in order to provide better consistency
between the IBC and IRC.

Bathtub, whirlpool tub
or hot tub
SG

B e R

|
m <60in. o
) ! ﬂ <60 in.
‘. ] Floor
Plan view Section view

SG = Safety glaziﬁg required
Measurements are to exposed glazing

s&
1 SG
SG i

in.i <60in.. |

Page 26

I NTER N A‘“ 0 N A! CODE COUNCIE’ Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License

Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.



2015 International Building Code —~Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic 2012 2015
Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials
(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued

Safety glazing — impact test |2406.2
The default impact test criteria have been revised to
impose the more restrictive test methodology. The
higher impact requirements will apply unless the
tables in Section 2406.2 allow for a lower impact test
to be used.
Safety glazing adjacent to 2406.4.7
bottom stair landing The height criteria for regulating glazing at the
’ Janding at the bottom of a stair has been revised
and the method for measuring the horizontal
distance has been clarified, now generally requiring
safety glazing if located less than 60 inches above
the bottom landing of the stair.
T { Glazing <60 in. above landing | |_1————|
1 ) and within 60 in. horizonzally T
| | of bottom tread nosing |
| 60 in. 1 is in a hazardous location. [ 60 in.
< 1 « Requires safety glazing, or
1 1 « Protection by guard per | Down
TTAT T T exception in Section 2406.4.7 |
1 | 1 !
: I i 180 . - ]
- : |
60in. | \ Glazing regulated
36in | \ 60 in. within a 60 in.
S | \ horizontal arc
\ if less than
N 180 degress
/ > - / from bottom
T tread nosing
2012 code did not regulate
glazing 236 in. in height (b) Plan
(a) Section
Water-resistive barriers for |2510.6
stucco applications In order to reduce the likelihood of moisture getting

into the building, detailed requirements have been
provided for the installation of the two layers of
weather-resistive barriers that are required behind
stucco-covered exterior walls.

Foam plastic insulation 2603.4.1.14 .

installed in floor assemblies | The use of 1/2-inch wood structural panels installed
on the walking surface side of a floor assembly is
now permitted as an alternative to the thermal
barrier typically required where foam plastic
insulation is installed within a floor assembly.
Special approval of foam 2603.9 (2603.10, 2603.10.1)

plastics The specific approval requirements now ensure that
the smoke development of all assemblies that
contain foam plastic is evaluated regardless of the

. test standard used.

Plastic composites 2612

New definitions and applicable test standards now
address the use of plastic composites for use as
exterior deck boards, stair treads, handrails and
guards.

Page 27

. INTERN A‘” U N AL CODE COUNCIL@ . ic;zr;gl:; :fnﬁgrme?ezzésfgi éﬁ};ﬁiﬁ;s RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Topic

[2012

]2015

Part 7 Building Services, Special Devices, and Special Conditions
(Chapters 27 through 34) ‘

Single-user toilet facilities

2902.2

Where separate sex toilet facilities are required and
only one water closet is required in each facility, two
family or assisted-use toilet rooms may now be
provided as an acceptable alternative.

Toilet facilities in parking
garages

2902.3

Public toilet facilities are no longer required in open
and enclosed parking garages and employee toilet
facilities are not required in those garages that do
not have parking attendants.

Public toilet facilities

'2902.3

Limited-size quick-service tenant spaces are no
longer required to provide toilet facilities for the
public customers.

Elevator hoistway venting

3004

The elevator hoistway venting provisions of Section
3004 have been deleted; such hoistways are no
longer required to be vented to the exterior.

Elevator lobbies and
hoistway opening
protection

3006
The elevator lobby requirements have been

* | relocated from Section 713.14.1, where they were

previously included with the general shaft enclosure
requirements, to Chapter 30, which addresses
elevators. Provisions now focus on hoistway
opening protection, with lobbies being one of three
options (enclosed lobbies, additional door, or
hoistway pressurization).

Fire service access
elevators, Occupant
evacuation elevators

3007
Many of the provisions addressing fire service access
elevators have now been coordinated with those

|applicable to occupant,evacuation elevators to

ensure that the fire service access elevators are able
to continue to function and serve their intended
purpose during an emergency.

3008

The provisions addressing occupant evacuation
elevators are now more closely coordinated with
those regulating fire service access elevators

Existing structures

Chapter 34 ’

Chapter 34 has been deleted from the IBC in its entirety,
and existing buildings will now be solely regulated by the
International Existing Building Code (IEBC).

Type B units in existing
buildings

IEBC 410 (3411)

Type B units are now required in existing buildings
when there is a change of occupancy or an alteration
and more than 50 percent of the building is affected.

Note: Because the 2015 IBC deleted Chapter 34, this
provision is no longer found within the IBC.
However, this requirement is located in the IEBC
which is adopted by reference in IBC Section 101.4.7.
In addition, because this requirement is more
restrictive than the requirements of the federal Fair
Housing Act, it is important code users are aware of
this change.

Page 28

Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL [recsisy mimstimshispesiey

S6kTLZO0T



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Notes:

Page 29

\ { L A '”DN AL CUDE COUNCILQ i(;gz'en;’%g; tt‘oﬁ?)ri};c;té:t?:resezgggfi éﬁ};ﬁiﬁ? RESERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 10:32:01 AM pursuant to License



2015 International Building Code —Transition from the 2009 IBC

Page 30

lNTRN AT i UN AL CODE COUNCIL@ igzgﬁ:; :.oﬁzrflix;ei );z‘;;(]:;}j éﬁ;‘;ﬁiz}?ds. IR)?SERVED); accessed by Peter McLaughlin on Jun 4, 2015 19:32:01 AM pursuant to License



